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THE CLIMATE POLICY NEEDS NEW IDEAS
Relevant for: Environment | Topic: Environmental Degradation - GHGs, Ozone Depletion and Climate Change

2021 will be the year for a new global climate policy and India has the soft power to bring
together the high and low emitters. Among the ‘major economies’, India will meet its Paris
Agreement target for 2030. Its per capita emissions are one-third of the global average and it will
remain within its share of ecological space.

In an urbanised world, two-third of emissions arise from the demand of the middle class for
infrastructure, mobility, buildings and diet. Well-being in cities is reflected in saturation levels of
infrastructure with consumption, not production, driving growth as well as high urban per capita
emissions. Infrastructure worldwide has used half of total materials, mainly construction, cement
and steel, which have no substitute, and will need half of the available carbon space before
comparable levels of infrastructure are reached globally around 2050. Peaking of emissions
comes some 20-30 years after saturation of infrastructure has been achieved, with related high
levels of well-being, as in the case of the West, before net zero emissions are considered. Prime
Minister Narendra Modi was justifiably cautious at the Climate Action Summit and avoided
commitments to cap emissions.

Editorial | Green over brown: On India's climate goals

Inequity is built into the climate treaty, which considers total emissions, size, and population,
making India the fourth largest emitter, even though, according to the United Nations, the richest
1% of the global population emits more than two times the emissions of the bottom 50%.
Clearly, net zero or carbon neutrality by 2050, and the cap on emissions it implies, applies only
to countries with high per capita emissions, GDP and well-being.

The focus on physical quantities indicates effects on nature whereas solutions require analysis
of drivers, trends and patterns of resource use. This anomaly explains why the link between
well-being, energy use and emissions is not on the global agenda. New thinking must enable
politics to acknowledge transformational social goals and the material boundaries of economic
activity and not the latter without the former. Modifying unsustainable patterns of natural
resource use and ensuring comparable levels of well-being are societal transformations and two
sides of a coin interlinked with international cooperation to serve sustainable development.

The vaguely worded ‘carbon neutrality’, balancing emitting carbon with absorbing carbon from
the atmosphere in forests, for example, is a triple whammy for latecomers like India. Such
countries already have less energy-intensive pathways that will not encroach on others’
ecological space, a young population, and are growing fast to reach comparable levels of well-
being with those already urbanised and in the middle class.

Also read | India set to exceed climate targets: Modi

Industrialisation and urbanisation are not the problem ‘per se’; the problem is the way they were
designed in the colonial context: keeping commodity prices low, overly resource-intensive,
defining progress as material abundance, and assuming that technology would solve the
ecological problem.

By 1950, the contribution of the U.S. to total emissions peaked at 40%. It has declined to
approximately 26%, the largest in the world. North America and Europe, with less than one-
quarter of the world population, are responsible for almost half of global material use. The share
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decreased to one-fifth in 2010, when Asia with half the world population used its legitimate share
of half of global resource use. But the ecological damage had already been done. China, with
four times the population of the U.S., accounts for 12% of cumulative emissions, and India, with
a population close to that of China’s, for just 3% of cumulative emissions that lead to global
warming.

Also read | UN chief urges global summit to declare ‘climate emergency’

Reconstruction in the West after World War II led to acceleration of material use, resulting
emissions and sharp rise in global temperature around 1970, before growth commenced in Asia.
Urban transformation requires huge amounts of iron and steel, cement, construction materials
and energy for infrastructure. Before infrastructure reaches saturation levels and manufacturing
stabilises, material use shapes ways in which countries build houses and transport
infrastructure, and how they organise mobility and deliver manufactured goods, food and
energy. With the population moving to cities, growth in per capita incomes drives consumption
and vehicle emissions becomes the continuing driver of increasing levels of material use, far
more significant than manufacturing.

In each sustainability benchmark like housing size and density, public bicycle transport and
eliminating food waste, India is doing better than the West. The rising prosperity of the world’s
poor does not endanger the planet; the challenge is to change wasteful behaviour in the West,
and these changes occur at decadal scales.

Comment | Reject this inequitable climate proposal

India must highlight its unique national circumstances. For example, the meat industry,
especially beef, contributes to one-third of global emissions. Indians eat just 4 kg of meat a year
compared to those in the European Union who eat about 65 kg and Americans who eat about
100 kg. Also to be noted is the fact that the average American household wastes nearly one-
third of its food.

Transport emissions account for a quarter of global emissions. They are the fastest-growing
emissions worldwide and have surpassed emissions from generation of electricity in the U.S.
Transport emissions are the symbol of Western civilisation and are not on the global agenda.

Comment | Flattening the climate curve

Coal accounts for a quarter of energy use. It powered colonialism. Rising Asia uses three-
quarters as coal drives industry and supports the renewable energy push into cities. India, with
abundant reserves and per capita electricity use that is one-tenth that of the U.S., is under
pressure to stop using coal, even as it aims to shift to electric vehicles and eliminate oil instead.

India has the credibility and legitimacy to push an alternate 2050 goal for countries currently with
per capita emissions below the global average — for example, the goal of well-being within
ecological limits, the frame of the Sustainable Development Goals, as well as multilateral
technological knowledge cooperation around electric vehicles, energy efficiency, building
insulation and a less wasteful diet.

Emissions are the symptom, not the cause of the problem. India, in the UN Security Council,
must push new ideas based on its civilisational and long-standing alternate values for the
transition to sustainability.

Mukul Sanwal is former Director of the United Nations Framework Convention on Climate
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Dear reader,

We have been keeping you up-to-date with information on the developments in India and the
world that have a bearing on our health and wellbeing, our lives and livelihoods, during these
difficult times. To enable wide dissemination of news that is in public interest, we have increased
the number of articles that can be read free, and extended free trial periods. However, we have
a request for those who can afford to subscribe: please do. As we fight disinformation and
misinformation, and keep apace with the happenings, we need to commit greater resources to
news gathering operations. We promise to deliver quality journalism that stays away from vested
interest and political propaganda.

Dear subscriber,

Thank you!

Your support for our journalism is invaluable. It’s a support for truth and fairness in journalism. It
has helped us keep apace with events and happenings.

The Hindu has always stood for journalism that is in the public interest. At this difficult time, it
becomes even more important that we have access to information that has a bearing on our
health and well-being, our lives, and livelihoods. As a subscriber, you are not only a beneficiary
of our work but also its enabler.

We also reiterate here the promise that our team of reporters, copy editors, fact-checkers,
designers, and photographers will deliver quality journalism that stays away from vested interest
and political propaganda.

Suresh Nambath

Please enter a valid email address.
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To reassure Indian Muslims, the PM needs to state that the govt. will not conduct an exercise
like NRC
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